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Under the leadership of Dr. Luis Mignucci, Neurospine Surgi-
cal Consultants continues to provide unparalleled medical care 
to the residents of Dallas-Fort Worth and surrounding areas 
that he has served for more than 33 years in the North Dallas 
and Plano areas. Dr. Mignucci is once again honored to be rec-
ognized by his peers as among the Best Doctors in Dallas. 

Dr. Mignucci graduated from the University of Puerto Rico 
School of Medicine department of neurological surgery. He 
completed his spine fellowship at the prestigious Cleveland 
Clinic Foundation and pursued additional specialized training 
at the National Hospital for Nervous Diseases at the Univer-
sity of London. Dr. Mignucci is one of the few neurosurgeons 
in the United States certified by both the American Board of 
Spine Surgery and the American Board of Neurological Sur-
gery. To further enhance his expertise, Dr. Mignucci has par-
ticipated in multiple clinical trials related to spine care and is 
actively involved in the design of advanced medical devices 
and equipment. During his 33 years of practice, Dr. Mignucci 
has developed special interest and mastery in the surgical 
management of spinal tumors and spine conditions, includ-
ing scoliosis and spondylolisthesis. Additionally, he performs 
minimally invasive procedures to treat ruptured discs in the 
cervical, thoracic, and lumbar spine. 

The Windhaven Medical Plaza provides a comprehensive 
and convenient venue for patients’ medical needs. It also 
houses Windhaven Medical Imaging, which has the most 
advanced 3T MRI equipment. Patients can be evaluated and 
undergo diagnostic studies, often on the same day, thereby 
enabling them to obtain an immediate solution. The Windhav-
en Ambulatory Surgery Center provides patients with a state-
of-the-art surgical facility in the same location, staffed by a 
highly trained and compassionate, professional personnel.

 The medical team at Neurospine Surgical Consultants 
offers the latest technologies in the diagnosis and manage-
ment of adult neurosurgical conditions, as well as the evalua-
tion and nonsurgical treatment of acute and chronic muscu-
loskeletal disorders.
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